

Auction Details	
Auction No	MSTC/BLR/Kerala Forest Department/33/Punalur/14-15/15918[93213]
Opening Date & Time	05-03-2015::15:00:00
Closing Date & Time	<b>Scheduled Time 05-03-2015::16:00:00</b> <b>Closed At 05-03-2015::16:00:00</b>
Inspection From Date	27-02-2015
Inspection Closing Date	04-03-2015

Seller Details	
Seller/Company Name	Kerala Forest Department
Location	Punalur
Street	Punalur
City	Kollam - 691305
Country	INDIA
Telephone	04752222617
Fax	04752222617
Email	dfo.ts.pnlr.for@kerala.gov.in
Contact Person	V R Jayakrishnan

LOT NO[PCB GRP]/LOT NAME	LOT DESC	QUANTITY	ED/(ST/VAT)	LOCATION
Lot No: 82/13 PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2] Lot Name: TEAK\LM\I\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LM\I\C Stock No=236/13, Girth= 1.54, Length= 4.70, Volume= 0.697 Stock No= 237/13, Girth= 1.51, Length= 4.65, Volume= 0.663 Stock No= 296/13, Girth= 1.50, Length= 4.65, Volume= 0.654 Total no of logs=3 1949 TP THURA- NO BID LOT	2.014 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
Lot No: 719/14 PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2] Lot Name: TEAK\LM\III\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LM\III\C Stock No=7820/13, Girth=0.77, Length=6.30, Volume=0.233 Stock No=7839/13, Girth=0.77, Length=4.00, Volume=0.148 Stock No=7840/13, Girth=0.90, Length=4.30, Volume=0.218 Stock No=7841/13, Girth=0.77, Length=7.20, Volume=0.267 Stock No=7842/13, Girth=0.81, Length=6.75, Volume=0.277 Stock No=7844/13, Girth=0.96, Length=2.60, Volume=0.150 Stock No=7845/13, Girth=0.81, Length=6.95, Volume=0.285 Stock No=7848/13, Girth=0.80, Length=5.80, Volume=0.232 Stock No=7850/13, Girth=0.83, Length=4.10, Volume=0.177 Stock No=7853/13, Girth=0.78, Length=4.30, Volume=0.164 Total no of logs=10 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.151 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
Lot No: 721/14 PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2] Lot Name: TEAK\LL\II\D	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\D Stock No= 7826/13, Girth= 1.33, Length= 8.75, Volume= 0.967 Stock No= 7836/13, Girth= 1.01, Length= 7.40, Volume= 0.472 Total no of logs=2 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	1.439 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
Lot No: 725/14	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No= 7855/13, Girth= 1.47, Length= 8.00, Volume= 1.080 Stock No= 7863/13, Girth= 1.30, Length= 8.00,			

<b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Volume= 0.845 Stock No= 7864/13, Girth= 1.47, Length= 7.90, Volume= 1.067 Stock No= 7865/13, Girth= 1.35, Length= 8.00, Volume= 0.911 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.903 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 728/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No= 7871/13, Girth= 1.67, Length= 8.05, Volume= 1.403 Stock No= 7872/13, Girth=1.60, Length=7.95, Volume= 1.272 Total no of logs=2 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.675 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 729/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No= 7873/13, Girth= 1.67, Length= 8.30, Volume= 1.447 Stock No= 7875/13, Girth= 1.52, Length= 8.10, Volume= 1.170 Stock No= 7881/13, Girth= 1.52, Length= 8.15, Volume= 1.177 Total no of logs=3 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.794 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 730/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LM\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LM\II\C Stock No= 7874/13, Girth= 1.54, Length= 4.65, Volume= 0.689 Total no of logs=1 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	0.689 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 732/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LM\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LM\II\C Stock No=7879/13,Girth=1.06,Length=7.1,Volume=0.499 Stock No=7883/13,Girth=1,Length=6.15,Volume=0.384 Stock No=7885/13,Girth=1.42,Length=3,Volume=0.378 Stock No=7893/13,Girth=1.2,Length=6.9,Volume=0.621 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	1.882 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 739/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No=7904/13,Girth=1.24,Length=8.35,Volume=0.802 Stock No=7905/13,Girth=1.37,Length=8.2,Volume=0.962 Stock No=7907/13,Girth=1.33,Length=8.1,Volume=0.896 Total no of logs=3 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.66 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 740/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LM\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LM\II\C Stock No=7906/13,Girth=0.138,Length=5.15,Volume=0.613 Stock No=7909/13,Girth=1.02,Length=5.6,Volume=0.364 Stock No=7910/13,Girth=1.24,Length=6.15,Volume=0.591 Total no of logs=3 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	1.568 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 743/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No=7915/13,Girth=1.06,Length=8.3,Volume=0.583 Stock No=7918/13,Girth=1.01,Length=8.25,Volume=0.526 Stock No=7919/13,Girth=1.07,Length=8.3,Volume=0.594 Stock No=7922/13,Girth=1.11,Length=8.1,Volume=0.624 Total no of logs=4	2.327 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala

	1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT			
<b>Lot No:</b> 744/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LM\III\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LM\III\C Stock No=7923/13,Girth=0.99,Length=5,Volume=0.306 Stock No=7924/13,Girth=0.84,Length=7.2,Volume=0.318 Stock No=7925/13,Girth=0.83,Length=5.8,Volume=0.250 Stock No=7927/13,Girth=0.82,Length=4.3,Volume=0.181 Stock No=7928/13,Girth=0.98,Length=6.7,Volume=0.402 Stock No=7935/13,Girth=0.84,Length=6.4,Volume=0.282 Total no of logs=6 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	1.739 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 749/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LM/IV/C	Lot Type: Teak/LM/IV/C Stock No-3241/14,Girth=0.64,Length=6.95,Volume=0.178 Stock No-3242/14,Girth=0.73,Length=5.5,Volume=0.183 Stock No-3244/14,Girth=0.64,Length=6.2,Volume=0.159 Stock No-3245/14,Girth=0.61,Length=4.5,Volume=0.105 Stock No-3246/14,Girth=0.61,Length=4.45,Volume=0.103 Total no of logs=5 1949 TP PARAKKULAM NO BID LOT	0.728 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 750/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/IIC	Lot Type: Teak/LL/IIC Stock No-7921/13,Girth=1.46,Length=8.1,Volume=1.079 Stock No-7943/13,Girth=1.39,Length=8.2,Volume=0.990 Stock No-7946/13,Girth=1.27,Length=8.2,Volume=0.827 Stock No-7952/13,Girth=1.34,Length=8.4,Volume=0.943 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.839 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 751/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LM/III/D	Lot Type: Teak/LM/III/D Stock No-7930/13,Girth=0.76,Length=6.8,Volume=0.245 Stock No-7931/13,Girth=0.84,Length=3.6,Volume=0.159 Total no of logs=2 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	0.404 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 752/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LM/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LM/II/C Stock No-7920/13,Girth=1.02,Length=6.35,Volume=0.413 Stock No-7947/13,Girth=1.01,Length=7.2,Volume=0.459 Stock No-7951/13,Girth=1.09,Length=4.9,Volume=0.364 Stock No-7955/13,Girth=1.07,Length=5,Volume=0.358 Stock No-7956/13,Girth=1.02,Length=4.5,Volume=0.293 Stock No-7957/13,Girth=1.01,Length=4.8,Volume=0.306 Stock No-7978/13,Girth=1.09,Length=4.6,Volume=0.342 Total no of logs=7 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.535 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock No-7944/13,Girth=1.09,Length=8.7,Volume=0.646 Stock No-7945/13,Girth=1.21,Length=8.3,Volume=0.760			

<b>Lot No:</b> 756/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Stock No- 7948/13,Girth=1.17,Length=8.25,Volume=0.706 Stock No- 7949/13,Girth=1.23,Length=8.1,Volume=0.766 Stock No- 7950/13,Girth=1.04,Length=8.2,Volume=0.554 Total no of logs=5 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.432 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 757/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock No- 7953/13,Girth=1.2,Length=8.35,Volume=0.752 Stock No- 7959/13,Girth=1.13,Length=8.2,Volume=0.654 Stock No- 7961/13,Girth=1.12,Length=8.3,Volume=0.651 Stock No- 7962/13,Girth=1.13,Length=9.05,Volume=0.722 Stock No- 7964/13,Girth=1.04,Length=8.3,Volume=0.561 Total no of logs=5 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.34 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 759/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LM/III/C	Lot Type: Teak/LM/III/C Stock No- 7963/13,Girth=0.83,Length=4.2,Volume=0.181 Stock No- 7968/13,Girth=0.92,Length=3.2,Volume=0.169 Stock No- 7969/13,Girth=0.8,Length=3.25,Volume=0.130 Stock No- 7970/13,Girth=0.91,Length=3.45,Volume=0.179 Stock No- 7971/13,Girth=0.77,Length=5.55,Volume=0.206 Stock No- 7972/13,Girth=0.88,Length=6.3,Volume=0.305 Total no of logs=6 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	1.17 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 765/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock No- 7992/13,Girth=1.37,Length=8.2,Volume=0.962 Stock No- 7998/13,Girth=1.36,Length=8.15,Volume=0.942 Stock No- 8000/13,Girth=1.34,Length=7.9,Volume=0.887 Stock No- 8005/13,Girth=1.36,Length=8.25,Volume=0.954 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.745 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 766/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/III/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/III/C Stock No- 7994/13,Girth=0.9,Length=8.25,Volume=0.418 Stock No-8012/13,Girth=98,Length=8,Volume=0.480 Stock No- 8014/13,Girth=0.83,Length=8.5,Volume=0.366 Stock No- 8015/13,Girth=0.92,Length=8.4,Volume=0.444 Stock No- 8016/13,Girth=0.9,Length=7.5,Volume=0.380 Stock No- 8017/13,Girth=0.98,Length=8.3,Volume=0.498 Stock No- 8033/13,Girth=0.87,Length=7.9,Volume=0.374 Stock No- 8035/13,Girth=0.98,Length=8.25,Volume=0.495 Stock No- 8038/13,Girth=0.84,Length=8,Volume=0.353 Total no of logs=9 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.808 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock No- 7995/13,Girth=1.05,Length=8.2,Volume=0.565 Stock No- 7996/13,Girth=1.08,Length=8.1,Volume=0.590			

<b>Lot No:</b> 767/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Stock No- 7999/13,Girth=1.13,Length=8.1,Volume=0.646 Stock No- 8002/13,Girth=1.08,Length=7.75,Volume=0.565 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.366 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 769/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock No- 8003/13,Girth=1.02,Length=8.25,Volume=0.536 Stock No- 8004/13,Girth=1.16,Length=8.3,Volume=0.698 Stock No- 8006/13,Girth=1.19,Length=8.2,Volume=0.726 Stock No- 8007/13,Girth=1.21,Length=7.75,Volume=0.709 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.669 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 772/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock No- 8022/13,Girth=116,Length=8.4,Volume=0.706 Stock No- 8024/13,Girth=114,Length=8.2,Volume=0.666 Stock No- 8027/13,Girth=1.35,Length=8,Volume=0.911 Stock No- 8031/13,Girth=1.11,Length=8.3,Volume=0.639 Stock No- 8025/13,Girth=1.36,Length=8.45,Volume=0.977 Total no of logs=5 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.899 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 773/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock No- 8019/13,Girth=1.06,Length=8.2,Volume=0.576 Stock No- 8020/13,Girth=1.16,Length=8.3,Volume=0.698 Stock No- 8030/13,Girth=1.11,Length=8.3,Volume=0.639 Total no of logs=3 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	1.913 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 774/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/I/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/I/C Stock No- 8046/13,Girth=1.66,Length=8.2,Volume=1.412 Stock No- 8047/13,Girth=1.55,Length=8.2,Volume=1.231 Total no of logs=2 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.643 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 776/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LM/I/C	Lot Type: Teak/LM/I/C Stock No- 2169/14,Girth=1.8,Length=3.05,Volume=0.618 Total no of logs=1 1949 TP PARAKKULAM NO BID LOT	0.618 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 779/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK/BS	Lot Type: TEAK/BS Stock No- 2167/14,Girth=0.51,Length=4.35,Volume=0.071 Stock No- 2215/14,Girth=0.58,Length=5.55,Volume=0.117 Stock No- 2220/14,Girth=0.51,Length=5.65,Volume=0.092 Total no of logs=3 1949 TP PARAKKULAM NO BID LOT	0.28 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 782/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b>	Lot Type: Teak/LL/I/C Stock No- 8049/13,Girth=1.62,Length=8.1,Volume=1.329 Stock No- 8051/13,Girth=1.66,Length=8.25,Volume=1.421	2.75 CUM	As Applicable /	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon

<b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/I/C	Total no of logs=2 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT		14.5%	State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 785/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock 8066/13,Girth=1.35,Length=8.1,Volume=0.923 No- Stock 8067/13,Girth=1.19,Length=9.3,Volume=0.823 No- Stock 8068/13,Girth=1.37,Length=8.2,Volume=0.962 No- Stock 8072/13,Girth=1.28,Length=8.45,Volume=0.865 No- Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.573 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 787/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock 8069/13,Girth=1.22,Length=8.05,Volume=0.749 No- Stock 8074/13,Girth=1.34,Length=8.3,Volume=0.931 No- Stock 8075/13,Girth=1.11,Length=8.2,Volume=0.631 No- Stock 8076/13,Girth=1.19,Length=7.95,Volume=0.704 No- Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.015 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 789/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock 8077/13,Girth=1.11,Length=9.1,Volume=0.701 No- Stock 8078/13,Girth=1.19,Length=8.7,Volume=0.770 No- Stock 8080/13,Girth=1.19,Length=8.4,Volume=0.743 No- Stock 8082/13,Girth=1.29,Length=8.05,Volume=0.837 No- Stock 8104/13,Girth=1.03,Length=8.15,Volume=0.540 No- Total no of logs=5 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.591 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 790/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock 8083/13,Girth=1.16,Length=8.1,Volume=0.681 No- Stock 8084/13,Girth=1.05,Length=8.25,Volume=0.568 No- Stock 8085/13,Girth=1.14,Length=7.55,Volume=0.613 No- Stock 8097/13,Girth=1.06,Length=8.25,Volume=0.579 No- Stock 8101/13,Girth=1.08,Length=9.2,Volume=0.671 No- Stock 8102/13,Girth=1.05,Length=8.2,Volume=0.565 No- Total no of logs=6 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.677 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 791/14 <b>PCB GRP :</b> [PRE-BID KFD2] <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/II/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/II/C Stock 8096/13,Girth=1.12,Length=8.2,Volume=0.643 No- Stock 8098/13,Girth=1.17,Length=8.3,Volume=0.710 No- Stock 8099/13,Girth=1.18,Length=8.3,Volume=0.722 No- Stock 8100/13,Girth=1.33,Length=8.3,Volume=0.918 No- Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.993 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 792/14	Lot Type: TEAK/LM/III/C Stock 8108/13,Girth=0.81,Length=6.8,Volume=0.279 No- Stock 8109/13,Girth=0.89,Length=6.7,Volume=0.332 No-			

<b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK/LM/III/C	Stock No- 8110/13,Girth=0.77,Length=5.7,Volume=0.211 Stock No- 8114/13,Girth=0.81,Length=2.75,Volume=0.113 Stock No- 8115/13,Girth=0.93,Length=7.3,Volume=0.395 Total no of logs=5 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	1.33 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 793/14 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> Teak/LL/III/C	Lot Type: Teak/LL/III/C Stock No- 8107/13,Girth=0.84,Length=8.3,Volume=0.366 Stock No- 8111/13,Girth=0.83,Length=8.3,Volume=0.357 Stock No- 8112/13,Girth=0.98,Length=8.25,Volume=0.495 Stock No- 8113/13,Girth=0.92,Length=8.3,Volume=0.439 Stock No- 8116/13,Girth=0.85,Length=7.55,Volume=0.341 Stock No- 8117/13,Girth=0.9,Length=7.75,Volume=0.392 Stock No- 8118/13,Girth=0.98,Length=7.55,Volume=0.453 Stock No- 8119/13,Girth=0.89,Length=8.1,Volume=0.401 Stock No- 8120/13,Girth=0.77,Length=8.25,Volume=0.306 Stock No- 8121/13,Girth=0.77,Length=8.2,Volume=0.304 Total no of logs=10 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.854 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 1/15 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No- 8127/13,Girth=1.24,Length=8.15,Volume=0.783 Stock No- 8128/13,Girth=1.42,Length=8.2,Volume=1.033 Stock No- 8131/13,Girth=1.38,Length=8.2,Volume=0.976 Stock No- 8134/13,Girth=1.18,Length=8.25,Volume=0.718 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	3.51 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 2/15 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No- 8129/13,Girth=1.11,Length=8.2,Volume=0.631 Stock No- 8130/13,Girth=1.28,Length=7.8,Volume=0.799 Stock No- 8137/13,Girth=1.39,Length=8.1,Volume=0.978 Total no of logs=3 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.408 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 3/15 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LL\II\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LL\II\C Stock No- 8133/13,Girth=1.07,Length=8.2,Volume=0.587 Stock No- 8135/13,Girth=1.17,Length=8.2,Volume=0.702 Stock No- 8138/13,Girth=1.1,Length=8.8,Volume=0.666 Stock No- 8139/13,Girth=1.07,Length=7.95,Volume=0.569 Total no of logs=4 1949 TP KUMMANNOOR NO BID LOT	2.524 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala
<b>Lot No:</b> 11/15 <b>PCB GRP :[PRE-BID KFD2]</b> <b>Lot Name:</b> TEAK\LM\III\C	Lot Type: TEAK\LM\III\C Stock No- 8675/13,Girth=1.04,Length=5.2,Volume=0.352 Total no of logs=1 1951 TP INCHAPPALLY NO BID LOT	0.352 CUM	As Applicable / 14.5%	Timber Sales Depot, Kadakkamon State :Kerala

Total No of Lots = 40

**Special Terms & Conditions****DEALING OFFICER AT MSTC LTD., TRIVANDRUM**

<b>NAME</b>	<b>MR. REMIL RASHID, JUNIOR MANAGER</b>
<b>OFFICE ADDRESS</b>	<b>NO 97, 5TH FLOOR, KERALA FOREST DEPT HEAD QUARTERS, VAZHUTHACAUD, TRIVANDRUM 695014</b>
<b>PHONE NO.</b>	<b>0471-2529137</b>
<b>OFFICE HOURS</b>	<b>10 AM - 5 PM</b>

THE TERMS & CONDITIONS INCLUDING THE LIST OF MATERIALS APPEARING ON THE DATE OF E-AUCTION AND UNDER "VIEW LIVE AUCTION" IS FINAL AND BINDING ON THE PARTICIPANT BIDDERS. THE E-AUCTION SALE IS GOVERNED BY THE GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS (GTC), BUYER SPECIFIC TERMS & CONDITIONS (BSTC) AND SPECIAL TERMS & CONDITIONS (STC) OF THE E-AUCTION. IN CASE OF ANY CONFLICT OR DIFFERENCES AMONG ANY PROVISIONS OF GTC, BSTC & STC, THE PROVISIONS OF STC WILL SUPERCEDE OTHERS IN THE PARTICULAR E-AUCTION.

**The unit of girth and length are in Metres. Unit of volume is in Cubic Metre.**

SPECIAL TERMS & CONDITIONS OF e-AUCTION

GENERAL TERMS & CONDITIONS OF e-AUCTION

BUYER SPECIFIC TERMS & CONDITIONS